Utility Maintenance Materials Bid Tabulation

Items and Descriptions

Estimated Annual Quantity

Underground Pipe & Valve

EJ

Vendors

Water Products

Ziebell

HD Supply

Fire Hydrant and Hydrant Supplies | Red 5.25" seat hydrant with 2x 2.5" NST nozzles, 1x 4.5" NST nozzle. Includes epoxy coated resilient wedge auxiliary valve with all stainless steel bolts attached and 6"

5' 6" Bury Hydrant with Valve Box, Cover, and Stabilizer 10 No Bid $2,398.47 No Bid $3,225.00 $2,875.00
6' Bury Hydrant with Valve Box, Cover, and Stabilizer 10 No Bid $2,435.47 No Bid $3,270.00 $2,915.00
6' 6" Bury Hydrant with Valve Box, Cover, and Stabilizer 10 No Bid $2,473.43 No Bid $3,375.00 $2,965.00
7' Bury Hydrant with Valve Box, Cover, and Stabilizer 10 No Bid $2,510.42 No Bid $3,420.00 $3,000.00
6" - Hydrant Extension Kit 6 No Bid $240.00 No Bid $450.00 $390.00
12" - Hydrant Extension Kit 6 No Bid $280.00 No Bid $535.00 $455.00
24" - Hydrant Extension Kit 2 No Bid $360.00 No Bid $689.00 $585.00
Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve | Includes 2" operating nut, opens left, stainless steel bolts on valve, mega lug and cor-ten accessary kit

6" MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 5 $515.00 $513.83 $659.00 $725.00 $605.00
8" MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 5 $815.00 $812.30 $1,020.00 $1,229.00 $955.00
10" MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 1 $1,260.00 $1,255.54 $1,580.00 $1,910.00 $1,480.00
6" Oversize MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 5 $815.00 $681.78 $885.00 $1,239.00 $1,280.00
8" Oversize MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 5 $1,215.00 $1,015.34 $1,350.00 $2,029.00 $1,960.00
10" Oversize MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 1 $1,760.00 $1,622.21 $1,945.00 No Bid No Bid
12" Oversize MJ x MJ Epoxy Coated Resilient Wedge Gate Valve 1 $2,200.00 $1,907.61 $2,469.00 No Bid No Bid
Surge Suppressor | Mechanical joints, all stainless steel

[6" surge Supressor 8 No Bid $2,100.00 | No Bid No Bid [ NoBid




